
-- ~~~~-~~~~--~- ---

Appendix VI:

Subtitle B of the Claims Resolution Act of2010
(Public Law 111-291)

-- --1



,--

124 STAT. 3158

Time periods.

PUBLIC LAW 111-291-DEC. 8,2010

(1) IN GENERAL.-Subjectto paragraph (2), the amendments
made by this section shall take effect 6 months after the date
of the enactment of this Act.

(2) COMPLIANCETRANSITIONPERIOD.-If the Secretary of
Health and Human Services determines that State legislation
(other than legislation appropriating funds) is required in order
for a State plan under part D of title IV of the Social Security
Act to meet the additional requirements imposed by the amend-
ment made by subsection (a), the plan shall not be regarded
as failing to meet such requirements before the first day of
the second calendar quarter beginning after the close of the
first regular session of the State legislature that begins after
the effective date of such amendment. If the State has a 2-
year legislative session, each year of the session is deemed
to be a separate regular session of the State legislature.

Subtitle B-TANF

SEC.811. EXTENSIONOF THE TEMPORARYASSISTANCEFOR NEEDY
FAMll..IESPROGRAM.

(a) IN GENERAL.-Activities authorized by part A of title IV
and section 1108(b) of the Social Security Act (other than the
Emergency Contingency Fund for State Temporary Assistance for
Needy Families Programs established under subsection (c) of section
403 of such Act) shall continue through September 30, 2011, in
the manner authorized for fiscal year 2010, and out of any money
in the Treasury of the United States not otherwise appropriated,
there are hereby appropriated such sums as may be necessary
for such purpose. Grants and payments may be made pursuant
to this authority on a quarterly basis through fiscal year 2011
at the level provided for such activities for the corresponding quarter
offiscal year 2010, except that-

(1) in the case of healthy marriage promotion and respon-
sible fatherhood grants under section 403(a)(2) of such Act,
such grants and payments shall be made in accordance with
the amendments made by subsection (b) ofthis section;

(2) in the case of supplemental grants under section
403(a)(3) of such Act-

(A) such grants and payments for the period beginning
on October 1, 2010, and ending on December 3, 2010,
shall not exceed the level provided for such grants and
payments under the Continuing Appropriations Act, 2011;
and

(B) such grants and payments for the period beginning
on December 4, 2010, and ending on June 30, 2011, shall
not exceed the amount equal to the difference between
$490,000,000 and such sums as are necessary for amounts
obligated under section 403(b) of the Social Security Act
on or after October 1, 2010, and before the date of enact-
ment of this Act; and
(3) in the case of the Contingency Fund for State Welfare

Programs established under section 403(b) of such Act, grants
and payments may be made in the manner authorized for
fiscal year 2010 through fiscal year 2012, in accordance with
the amendments made by subsection (c) of this section.



PUBLIC LAW 111-291-DEC. 8, 2010 124 STAT. 3159

(b) HEALTHYMARRIAGEPROMOTIONANDRESPONSIBLEFATHER~
HOODGRANTS.-Section 403(a)(2) of the Social Security Act (42
U.S.C. 603(a)(2» is amended-

(1) in subparagraph (A)-
(A) in clause (D, by striking "and (C)" and inserting

", (C), and (E)";
(B) in clause (ii), in the matter preceding subclause

(1), by inserting "(or, in the case of an entity seeking
funding to carry out healthy marriage promotion activities
and activities promoting responsible fatherhood, a com-
bined application that contains assurances that the entity
will carry out such activities under separate programs and
shall not combine any funds awarded to carry out either
such activities)" after "an application"; and

(C) in clause (iii), by striking subclause (III) and
inserting the following:

"(III) Marriage education, marriage skills, and
relationship skills programs, that may include par-
enting skills, financial management, conflict reso-
lution, and job and career advancement.";

(2) in subparagraph (C)(i), by striking "$50,000,000" and
inserting "$75 000 000'" .

(3) by strikiz{g subparagraph (D) and inserting the fol-
lowing:

"(D) APPROPRIATION.-Out of any money in the
Treasury of the United States not otherwise appropriated,
there are appropriated for fiscal year 2011 for expenditure
in accordance with this paragraph-

"(i) $75,000,000 for awarding funds for the purpose
of carrying out healthy marriage promotiori activities;
and

"(ii) $75,000,000 for awarding funds for the pur-
pose of carrying out activities promoting responsible
fatherhood.

Ifthe Secretary makes an award under subparagraph (B)(i)
for fiscal year 2011, the funds for such award shall be
taken in equal portion from the amounts appropriated
under clauses (i) and (ii)."; and
(4) by adding at the end the following:

"(E) PREFERENCE.-Inawarding funds under this para-
graph for fiscal year 2011, the Secretary shall give pref-
erence to entities that were awarded funds under this
paragraph for any prior fiscal year and that have dem-
onstrated the ability to successfully carry out the programs
funded under this paragraph.".

(c) CONTINGENCYFUND.-Section 403(b)(2) of the Social Secu-
rity Act (42 U.S.C. 603(b)(2», as amended by section 131(b)(2)(A)
of the Continuing Appropriations Act, 2011, is amended-

(1) by striking "$506,000,000" and inserting "such sums
as are necessary for amounts obligated on or after October
1, 2010, and before the date of enactment of the Claims Resolu-
tion Act of2010,"; and

(2) by striking ", reduced" and all that follows up to the
period.
(d) CONFORMINGAMENDMENTS.-Section403(a)(3) of the Social

Security Act (42 U.S.C. 603(a)(3», as amended by section 131(b)(1)
of the Continuing Appropriations Act, 2011, is amended-



I

I

!
!

I
l------

124 STAT. 3160 PUBLIC LAW 111-291-DEC. 8, 2010

(1) in subparagraph (F)-
(A) by inserting "(or portion of a fiscal year)" after

"a fiscal year"; and
(B) by inserting "(or portion of the fiscal year)" after

''the fiscal year" each place it appears; and
(2) by striking clause (ii) of subparagraph (H) and inserting

the following:
"(ii) subparagraph (G) shall be applied as if 'fiscal

year 2011' were substituted for 'fiscal year 2001';".

SEC.812.MODIFICATIONSTOTANFDATAREPORTING.
(a) IN GENERAL.-Section 411 of the Social Security Act (42

U.S.C. 611) is amended by adding at the end the following new
subsection:

"(c) PRE-REAUTHORIZATIONSTATE-BY-STATEREPORTS ON
ENGAGEMENTIN ADDITIONALWORKACTIVITIESANDEXPENDITURES
FOROTHERBENEFITSAND SERVICES.-

"(1) STATEREPORTINGREQUIREMENTS.-
"(A) REPORTING PERIODS AND DEADLINES.-Each

eligible State shall submit to the Secretary the following
reports:

"(i) MARCH2011 REPORT.-Not later than May 31,
2011, a report for the period that begins on March
1, 2011, and ends on March 31, 2011, that contains
the information specified in subparagraphs (B) and
(C).

"(ii) APRIL-JUNE,2011 REPORT.-Not later than
August 31, 2011, a report for the period that begins
on April 1,·2011, and ends on June 30, 2011, that
contains with respect to the 3 months that occur during
that period-

"(I) the average monthly numbers for the
information specified in subparagraph (B); and

"(II) the information specified in subparagraph
(C).

"(B) ENGAGEMENTIN ADDITIONALWORKACTIVITIES.-
"(i) With respect to each work-eligible individual

in a family receiving assistance during a reporting
period specified in subparagraph (A), whether the indi-
vidual engages in any activities directed toward
attaining self-sufficiency during a month occurring in
a reporting period, and if so, the specific activities-

"(I) that do not qualify as a work activity
under section 407(d) but that are otherwise reason-
ably calculated to help the family move toward
self-sufficiency; or

"(II) that are of a type that would be counted
toward the State participation rates under section
407 but for the fact that-

"(aa) the work-eligible individual did not
engage in sufficient hours ofthe activity;

"(bb) the work-eligible individual has
reached the maximum time limit allowed for
having participation in the activity counted
toward the State's work participation rate; or



PUBLIC LAW 111-291-DEC. 8,2010 124 STAT. 3161

"(cc) the number of work-eligible individ-
uals engaged in such activity exceeds a limita-
tion under such section.

"(ii) Any other information that the Secretary
determines appropriate with respect to the inforination
required under clause (i), including if the individual
has no hours of participation, the principal reason
or reasons for such non-participation.
"(C) EXPENDITURESON OTHERBENEFITSAND SERV-

lCES.-
"(i) Detailed, disaggregated information regarding

the types of, and amounts of, expenditures made by
the State during a reporting period specified in
subparagraph (A) using-

"(I) Federal funds provided under section 403
that are (or will be) reported by the State on
Form ACF-196 (or any successor form) under the
category of other expenditures or the category of
benefits or services provided in accordance with
the authority provided under section 404(a)(2); or

"(II) State funds expended to meet the require-
ments of section 409(a)(7) and reported by the
State in the category of other expenditures on
Form ACF-196 (or any successor form).
"(ii) Any other information that the Secretary

determines appropriate with respect to the information
required under clause (i),

"(2) PuBLICATIONOF SUMMARYANDANALYSISOF ENGAGE-
MENTIN ADDITIONALACTIVITIES.-Concurrent with the submis-
sion of each report required under paragraph (1)(A), an eligible
State shall publish on an Internet website maintained by the
State agency responsible for administering the State program
funded under this part (or such State-maintained website as
the Secretary may approve)-

"(A) a summary of the information submitted in the
report:

"(B) an analysis statement regarding the extent to
which the information changes measures of total engage-
ment in work activities from what was (or will be) reported
by the State in the quarterly report submitted under sub-
section (a) for the comparable period; and

"(C) a narrative describing the most common activities
contained in the report that are not countable toward the
State participation rates under section 407.
"(3) APPLICATIONOF AUTHORITYTO USE SAMPLING.-

Subparagraph (B) of subsection (a)(1) shall apply to the reports
required under paragraph (1) of this subsection in the same
manner as subparagraph (B) of subsection (a)(1) applies to
reports required under subparagraph (A) of subsection (a)(1).

"(4) SECRETARIALREPORTSTOCONGRESS.-
"(A) MARCH2011 REPORT.-Not later than June 30,

2011, the Secretary shall submit to Congress a report on
the information submitted by eligible States for the March
2011 reporting period under paragraph (1)(A)(i).The report
shall include a State-by-State summary and analysis of
such information, identification of any States with missing
or incomplete reports, and recommendations for such



124 STAT. 3162 PUBLIC LAW 111-291-DEC. 8,2010

administrative or legislative changes as the Secretary
determines are necessary to require eligible States to report
the information on a recurring basis.

"(B) APRIL-JUNE,2011 REPORT.-Not later than Sep-
tember 30, 2011, the Secretary shall submit to Congress
a report on the information submitted by eligible States
for the April-June 2011 reporting period under paragraph
(1)(A)(ii). The report shall include a State-by-State sum-
mary and analysis of such information, identification of
any States with missing or incomplete reports, and rec-
ommendations for such administrative or legislative
changes as the Secretary determines are necessary to
require eligible States to report the information on a recur-
ring basis .
"(5) AUTHORITYFOR EXPEDITIOUSIMPLEMENTATION.-The

requirements of chapter 5 of title 5, United States Code (com-
monly referred to as the 'Administrative Procedure Act') or
any other law relating to rulemaking or publication in the
Federal Register shall not apply to the issuance of guidance
or instructions by the Secretary with respect to the implementa-
tion of this subsection to the extent the Secretary determines
that compliance with any such requirement would impede the
expeditious implementation of this subsection.".
(b) APPLICATIONOF PENALTYFORFAILURETo FILE REPORT.-

(1) IN GENERAL.-8ection 409(a)(2) of such Act (42 U.S.C.
609(a)(2» is amended-

(A) by redesignating subparagraphs (A) and (B) as
clauses (i) and (ii), respectively,

(B) by inserting before clause (i) (as redesignated by
paragraph (1», the following:

"(A)QUARTERLYREPORTS.-";
(C) in clause (ii) of subparagraph (A) (as redesignated

by paragraphs (1) and (2», by striking "subparagraph (A)"
and inserting "clause (i)"; and

(D) by adding at the end the following:
"(B) REPORTON ENGAGEMENTIN ADDITIONALWORK

ACTIVITIESANDEXPENDITURESFOR OTHERBENEFITSAND
SERVICES.-

"(i) IN GENERAL.-Ifthe Secretary determines that
a State has not submitted the report required by sec-
tion 411(c)(I)(A)(i) by May 31, 2011, or the report
required by section 411(c)(I)(A)(ii) by August 31,2011,
the Secretary shall reduce the grant payable to the
State under section 403(a)(I) for the immediately suc-
ceeding fiscal year by an amount equal to not more
than 4 percent of the State family assistance grant.

"(ii) RESCISSIONOFPENALTY.-The Secretary shall
rescind a penalty imposed on a State under clause
(i) with respect to a report required by section
411(c)(I)(A) if the State submits the report not later
than-

"(1) in the case of the report required under
section 411(c)(I)(A)(i), June 15, 2011; and

"(II) in the case of the report required under
section 411(c)(I)(A)(ii), September 15,2011.
"(iii) PENALTYBASEDON SEVERITYOF FAILURE.-

The Secretary shall impose a reduction under clause



PUBLIC LAW 111-291-DEC. 8, 2010 124 STAT. 3163

(i) with respect to a fiscal year based on the degree
of noncompliance.".

(2) APPLICATIONOF REASONABLECAUSEEXCEPTION.-Sec-
tion 409(b)(2) of such Act (42 U.S.C. 609(b)(2» is amended
by inserting before the period the following: "and, with respect
to the penalty under paragraph (2)(B) of subsection (a), shall
only apply to the extent the Secretary determines that the
reasonable cause for failure to comply with a requirement of
that paragraph is as a result of a one-time, unexpected event;
such as a widespread data system failure or a natural or
man-made disaster".

(3) NONAPPLICATIONOF CORRECTIVECOMPLIANCEPLAN
PROVISIONS.-Section409(c)(4) of such Act (42 U.S.C. 609(c)(4»
is amended by inserting "(2)(B)," after "paragraph".

Subtitle C-Customs User Fees; Continued
Dumping and Subsidy Offset

SEC. 821. CUSTOMS USER FEES.
Section 1303i(j)(3) of the Consolidated Omnibus Budget Rec-

onciliation Act of 1985 (19 U.S.C. 58c(j)(3» is amended-
(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking "December 10, 2018"

and inserting "September 30, 2019"; and
(2) in subparagraph (B)(i), by striking "November 30, 2018"

and inserting "September 30,2019".

SEC. 822. LIMITATION ON DISTRIBUTIONS RELATING TO REPEAL OF
CONTINUED DUMPING AND SUBSIDY OFFSET.

Notwithstanding section 1701(b) of the Deficit Reduction Act
of 2005 (Public Law 109-171; 120 Stat. 154 (19 U.S.C. 1675c note»
or any other provision of law, no payments shall be distributed
under section 754 of the Tariff Act of 1930, as in effect on the

. day before the date of the enactment of such section 1701, with
respect to the entries of any goods that are, on the date of the
enactment of this Act-

(1) unliquidated; and
(2)(A) not in litigation; or
(B) not under an order of liquidation from the Department

of Commerce.

Subtitle D-Emergency Fund for Indian
Safety and Health

SEC. 881. EMERGENCY FUND FOR INDIAN SAFETY AND HEALTH.
Section 601 of the Tom Lantos and Henry J. Hyde United

States Global Leadership Against HIV/ AIDS, Tuberculosis, and
Malaria Reauthorization Act of 2008 (25 U.S.C. 443c) is amended-

(1) in subsection (b)(1), by striking "$2,000,000,000" and
inserting "$1,602,619,000"; and

(2) in subsection (f)(2)(B), by striking "50 percent" and
inserting "not more than $602,619,000".


